Shiawassee County Road Commission
2026 Sand

Bid Opening on February 24, 2026

Board Approved on March 10, 2026

2 NS Sand 2 NS Sand 2 NS Sand Class Il Sand Class Il Sand
Delivered Delivered Picked Up Delivered Picked Up
Bidder Corunna Perry Corunna

L&D C;;ﬁ‘_’ggégjgszir”‘:kmg $16.72 $17.61 NO BID NO BID NO BID
FromgrggF_ggg_S(;gnging $9.60 $9.60 NO BID $9.60 NO BID
Grzagtg%jh‘gifgzio” $11.30 $11.30 NO BID $9.50 NO BID
Jagcggir;lrggl;gg $9.50 $9.50 $10.25 $9.25 $10.00
58?;’;:;‘92"42 $10.25 $10.25 NO BID $9.65 NO BID
Sumbera $10.20 $12.30 $6.00 $9.95 $5.75

989-723-1985




