
22A / Ton 22A / Ton 23A / Ton 23A / Ton

Bidder Delivered Picked Up Delivered Picked Up

Great Lakes Fusion

989-413-4125

Jackson Trucking

989-494-9979

Ocenasek

517-625-3242

Stoneco

269-716-6006

Sumbera

989-723-1985

$16.10 NO BID $16.10 NO BID

Shiawassee County Road Commission

2026 Process Gravel

Bid Opening on February 24, 2026

Board Approved on March 10, 2026

$16.00 $17.25 $16.00 $17.25

$15.50 NO BID $15.50 NO BID

$16.00 $10.25 $16.00 $10.25

$16.45 $12.25 $16.45 $12.25


