
Burroughs North Fisher Transportation Fromm Farms Trucking Jackson Trucking Ocenasek Stoneco Sumbera
989-737-2861 989-773-1376 989-666-6263 989-494-9979 517-625-3242 269-716-6006 989-723-1985

23A                                    

Delivered Corunna Ave
$31.75 $34.65 $30.50 $30.70 $31.80 $28.75 NO BID

22A                                    

Delivered Corunna Ave
$31.75 $34.65 $30.50 $30.70 $31.80 NO BID NO BID

3/8"x1/8" Durpatcher Stone                                    

Delivered Corunna Ave
$33.96 $41.56 * NO BID NO BID $41.24 NO BID NO BID

23A                                    

Delivered Lansing Rd
$32.75 $36.18 $31.50 $31.20 $31.90 $29.25 NO BID

22A                                    

Delivered Lansing Rd
$32.75 $36.18 $31.50 $31.20 $31.90 NO BID NO BID

23A                                    

Delivered Ruess Rd
$31.75 $36.29 $31.00 $30.70 $33.20 $29.75 NO BID

22A                                    

Delivered Ruess Rd
$31.75 $36.29 $31.00 $30.70 $33.20 NO BID NO BID

23A                                    

Picked Up
NO BID NO BID NO BID $32.70 NO BID $22.75 $33.00

22A                                    

Picked Up
NO BID NO BID NO BID $32.70 NO BID NO BID $33.00

3/8"x1/8" Durpatcher Stone                                    

Picked Up
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

*Alternate bid. H-1 Blue 

Limestone, MDOT Spec for 

AMZ. See attached spec 

sheet.

Bidders

Shiawassee County Road Commission
2026 Limestone

Bid opening on February 24, 2026

Board Approved on March 10, 2026


