
Bidder L & D Carey & Sons Carrick Trucking Fisher Transportation Jackson Trucking Ocenasek Inc Russell Landscaping

231-856-4324 989-422-4198 989-773-1376 989-494-2779 517-625-3242 313-600-4883

Antrim 23A Ruess $4.93 $4.50 $7.65 $4.96 $5.11 $13.30

Bennington 23A Ruess $3.23 $3.04 $5.73 $2.67 $3.72 $13.30

Burns 23A Ruess $6.15 NO BID $9.09 $5.78 $6.10 $13.30

Caledonia 23A Ruess $3.92 NO BID $6.21 $4.02 $4.02 $13.30

Fairfield 23A Ruess $3.73 $3.39 $5.97 $3.74 $4.07 $13.30

Hazelton 23A Ruess $5.46 NO BID $8.13 $5.39 $5.39 $13.30

Middlebury 23A Ruess $3.07 $2.72 $5.01 $3.03 $3.03 $13.30

New Haven 23A Ruess $4.16 $3.83 $7.41 $4.24 $4.29 $13.30

Owosso 23A Ruess $2.73 $2.47 $5.01 $2.76 $2.90 $13.30

Perry 23A Ruess $3.75 $3.48 $6.45 $3.84 $3.84 $13.30

Rush 23A Ruess $3.61 $3.31 $5.97 $3.69 $3.71 $13.30

Sciota 23A Ruess $3.61 $3.33 $6.45 $3.71 $3.71 $13.30

Shiawassee 23A Ruess $4.11 $3.70 $7.89 $4.11 $4.33 $13.30

Venice 23A Ruess $4.82 NO BID $7.65 $4.91 $4.99 $13.30

Vernon 23A Ruess $5.15 NO BID $8.85 $5.33 $5.54 $13.30

Woodhull 23A Ruess $4.48 $4.06 $7.41 $4.48 $4.83 $13.30

↑
Ruess Road Pit 23A - material cost not included in bid price

Contractor supplied 23A & 22A - material included in bid price

Shiawassee County Road Commission

2026 Gravel Hauling Bid - Ruess Road Pit

Board Approved on February 10, 2026

Bid Extension from February 27, 2024


