Shiawassee County Road Commission
2026 Gravel Hauling Bid - Private Source
Bid Opening on February 24, 2026

Board Approved on March 10, 2026

Bidder L & D Carey Fisher Transportation Ocenasek
231-856-4324 989-773-1376 517-625-3242
Antrim 23A Private NO BID NO BID $15.80
Antrim 22A Private NO BID NO BID $15.80
Bennington 23A Private NO BID $18.70 $15.00
Bennington 22A Private NO BID NO BID $15.00
Burns 23A Private NO BID NO BID $17.10
Burns 22A Private NO BID NO BID $17.10
Caledonia  23A Private $17.07 $18.81 $15.50
Caledonia  22A Private $18.17 NO BID $15.50
Fairfield 23A Private $14.40 $16.50 $15.50
Fairfield 22A Private $15.50 NO BID $15.50
Hazelton 23A Private $17.87 NO BID $18.10
Hazelton 22A Private $18.97 NO BID $18.10
Middlebury 23A Private $14.33 $17.10 $14.90
Middlebury 22A Private $15.93 NO BID $14.90
New Haven 23A Private $16.72 $19.31 $17.10
New Haven 22A Private $17.82 NO BID $17.10
Owosso 23A Private $15.78 $17.38 $14.90
Owosso 22A Private $16.88 NO BID $14.90
Perry 23A Private NO BID NO BID $16.10
Perry 22A Private NO BID NO BID $16.10
Rush 23A Private $15.78 $17.71 $15.10
Rush 22A Private $16.88 NO BID $15.10
Sciota 23A Private NO BID $17.55 $15.50
Sciota 22A Private NO BID NO BID $15.50
Shiawassee 23A Private NO BID NO BID $15.50
Shiawassee 22A Private NO BID NO BID $15.50
Venice 23A Private NO BID NO BID $16.90
Venice 22A Private NO BID NO BID $16.90
Vernon 23A Private NO BID NO BID $18.00
Vernon 22A Private NO BID NO BID $18.00
Woodhull 23A Private NO BID NO BID $17.10
Woodhull 22A Private NO BID NO BID $17.10




