
Price per ton Price per ton
Delivered to Delivered to Price per ton

Bidder  Corunna Perry Picked Up Notes

Burroughs North

989-737-2861

Carrick Trucking & Gravel

989-422-4198

Fromm Farms Trucking

989-666-6263

Great Lakes Fusion

989-413-4125

Jackson Trucking

989-494-9979

Ocenasek

517-625-3242

Sumbera

989-723-1985

Shiawassee County Road Commission

2026 6A Stone

Bid Opening on February 24, 2026

Board Approved on March 10, 2026

$37.05 $38.05 NO BID Limestone

$33.25 $32.75 $20.10 Available if in stock

$23.75 $23.75 NO BID

$24.50 $24.50 NO BID

$22.00 $22.00 $23.25

$23.10 $23.10 NO BID

$23.70 $25.80 $19.50


