
Fuel Bid Delivered

Summer Winter Lock In Over Cost

 Coffield Oil Company
989-634-9156

J & H Oil Company
616-291-5684

Webster & Garner, Inc
810-938-0102

Station Pick Up  -  Card System Required

Summer Winter Lock In Over Cost

 Coffield Oil Company
989-634-9156

J & H Oil Company
616-291-5684

Webster & Garner, Inc
810-938-0102

Current Rack Cost

Per Gallon Lock In Over Cost

 Coffield Oil Company
989-634-9156

J & H Oil Company
616-291-5684

Webster & Garner, Inc
810-938-0102

Shiawassee County Road Commission

Fuel Bid - Period November 1, 2025 through October 31, 2026

Bid Extension from October 9, 2024

2.2780 2.2980

Notes

2.4085
Summer  .11                       

Winter    .13

2.2820

2.2780

0.17

2.2643 2.2793 0.10

0.17

NO BID

Board Approved on September 24, 2025

No 2 Diesel Fuel

0.06

2.4085

No 2 Diesel Fuel

No Lead Fuel

2.2980 0.06

2.1858

NO BID NO BID

0.06

NO BID

Current Rack Cost Per Gallon

Current Rack Cost Per Gallon

NO BID

2.2643 2.2793

Notes


