
High Intensity Prismatic Dornbos MD Solutions

MI State Ind 

(new)

MI State Ind 

(recycled) Newman Sign Solutions

517-543-4000 614-873-2222 517-335-3771 517-335-3771 800-437-9770 701-566-1008

30"x 30" STOP $30.25 NO BID $34.84 $27.19 $29.75 $38.58

30"x 30" STOP AHEAD SYMBOL $33.44 NO BID $36.87 $29.19 $32.26 $51.90

36"X 36" STOP $43.56 NO BID $50.22 $39.15 $41.20 $55.56

36"X 36" STOP AHEAD SYMBOL $48.51 NO BID $52.22 $41.15 $42.82 $74.73

30"X 30" YIELD SYMBOL $21.78 NO BID $22.31 $17.40 $36.73 $51.90

36" RR ADVANCE WARNING $43.56 NO BID $50.22 $39.15 $43.74 $55.89

48"X 9" RAILROAD CROSS BUCK ASSEMBLY $86.33 NO BID NO BID $13.05 $46.73 $24.54

12"X 6" REGULATORY $4.33 NO BID $2.79 $2.20 $7.61 $4.60

12"X 12" REGULATORY $6.65 NO BID $5.58 $4.35 $10.81 $9.20

12"X 18" REGULATORY $8.58 NO BID $8.37 $6.53 $11.63 $11.10

18"X 6" REGULATORY $5.49 NO BID $4.18 $3.26 $8.57 $6.90

18"X 18" REGULATORY $11.09 NO BID $12.56 $9.79 $15.62 $16.65

24"x 10" REGULATORY $10.44 NO BID $9.30 $7.25 $12.10 $14.22

24"x 12" REGULATORY $10.00 NO BID $11.16 $8.70 $13.39 $14.80

24"x 18" REGULATORY $14.52 NO BID $16.74 $13.05 $17.25 $22.19

24"x 24" REGULATORY $19.36 NO BID $22.32 $17.40 $22.35 $29.59

24"x 30" REGULATORY $24.20 NO BID $27.90 $21.75 $24.94 $36.99

30"x 12" REGULATORY $12.10 NO BID $13.95 $10.88 $15.30 $18.50

30"x 30" REGULATORY $30.25 NO BID $34.87 $27.19 $29.75 $43.78

30"x 36" REGULATORY $36.30 NO BID $41.85 $32.63 $34.54 $52.53

36"x 12" REGULATORY $14.52 NO BID $14.55 $13.05 $17.22 $22.19

48"x 24" REGULATORY $38.72 NO BID $44.64 $34.80 $47.44 $61.38

48"x 30" REGULATORY $48.40 NO BID $55.80 $43.50 $44.12 $76.72

60"x 30" REGULATORY $60.50 NO BID $69.75 $54.38 $57.99 $95.90

18"x 18" WARNING $10.89 NO BID $12.56 $9.79 $14.37 $16.65

18"x 24" WARNING $14.52 NO BID $16.74 $13.05 $17.24 $22.19

30"x 12" WARNING $12.10 NO BID $13.95 $10.88 $22.32 $18.50

24"x 30" WARNING $24.20 NO BID $27.90 $21.75 $24.94 $36.99

30"x 30" WARNING $30.25 NO BID $34.87 $27.19 $29.75 $43.78

12"x 36" WARNING $14.52 NO BID $16.74 $13.05 $17.22 $22.19

36"x 36" WARNING $43.56 NO BID $52.22 $39.15 $40.31 $63.04

48"x 24" WARNING $38.72 NO BID $44.64 $34.80 $36.43 $61.38

24"x 8"  YELLOW/GREEN SCHOOL 3M #4083 $9.44 NO BID $10.26 $8.53 $12.01 $10.74

24"x 12" YELLOW/GREEN SCHOOL 3M #4083 $12.46 NO BID $15.40 $12.80 $15.10 $17.40

30"x 30" YELLOW/GREEN SCHOOL 3M #4083 $38.95 NO BID $41.88 $40.00 $35.92 $51.90

36"x 36" YELLOW/GREEN SCHOOL 3M #4083 $56.08 NO BID $69.30 $57.60 $53.28 $74.74

24"x 12" CONSTRUCTION $9.68 NO BID $11.16 $8.70 $13.39 $14.89
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24"x 18" CONSTRUCTION $14.52 NO BID $16.74 $13.05 $17.25 $22.34

30"x 24" CONSTRUCTION $24.20 NO BID $27.90 $21.75 $24.94 $37.23

30"x 30" CONSTRUCTION $30.25 NO BID $36.87 $27.19 $29.75 $44.07

36"x 36" CONSTRUCTION $43.56 NO BID $52.22 $39.15 $40.31 $63.47

48"x 18" CONSTRUCTION $36.30 NO BID $33.48 $26.10 $28.74 $49.37

48"x 48" CONSTRUCTION $96.80 NO BID $89.28 $69.60 $69.04 $123.52

24"x 6" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 3/4" RADIUS $5.65 NO BID $5.58 $4.35 $8.04 $9.20

30"x 6" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 3/4" RADIUS $7.06 NO BID $6.97 $5.44 $9.00 $9.25

36"x 6" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 3/4" RADIUS $8.48 NO BID $8.37 $6.53 $9.96 $11.10

42"x 6" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 3/4" RADIUS $9.89 NO BID $9.77 $7.61 $11.30 $12.95

48"x 6" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 3/4" RADIUS $11.30 NO BID $11.16 $8.70 $12.30 $14.80

24"x 9" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 1-1/2" RADIUS $8.48 NO BID $8.37 $6.53 $9.00 $11.10

30"x 9" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 1-1/2" RADIUS $10.62 NO BID $10.46 $8.16 $10.44 $13.87

36"x 9" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 1-1/2" RADIUS $12.71 NO BID $12.55 $9.79 $11.87 $16.65

42"x 9" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 1-1/2" RADIUS $14.86 NO BID $14.64 $11.42 $13.31 $19.42

48"x 9" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 1-1/2" RADIUS $16.95 NO BID $16.74 $13.05 $14.75 $22.19

3M HIP REFLECTIVE SHEETING WHITE #3930 24"x50 YDS $391.00 $402.95 $297.00 $297.00 $360.00 $397.92

3M HIP REFLECTIVE SHEETING WHITE #3930 30"x50 YDS $478.75 $503.00 $371.25 $371.25 $450.00 $489.52

3M HIP REFLECTIVE SHEETING YELLOW #3931 24"x50 YDS $391.00 $402.95 $297.00 $297.00 $360.00 $397.92

3M HIP REFLECTIVE SHEETING YELLOW #3931 30"x50 YDS $478.75 $503.00 $371.25 $371.25 $450.00 $489.52

3# FT. GREEN U CHANNEL SIGN POSTS $2.55 $2.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3# FT. GALVANIZED U CHANNEL SIGN POSTS $3.42 $3.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

24"x 8" HIP TYPE II BARRICADES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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