Shiawassee County Road Commission

2025 Limestone

Bid opening on March 11, 2025
Board Approved on March 24, 2025

Bidders 23A Delivered 22A Delivered 3/16 x 1/8 Chip 23A Delivered 22A Delivered 23A Delivered 22A Delivered 23A 22A

Corunna Ave Corunna Ave Delivered Corunna Lansing Rd Lansing Rd Ruess Rd Ruess Rd Picked Up Picked Up

Burroughs-Wirt Stone Dock $29.00 $29.00 NO BID $30.00 $30.00 $29.50 $29.50 NO BID NO BID
989-737-2861

Fisher Transportation $31.80 $31.00 |HlBluealtemate, ] 43) 35 $32.32 $33.40 $33.40 NO BID NO BID

989-773-1376 $40.22 per ton

Fromm Farms $27.00 $27.00 NO BID $28.50 $28.50 $28.00 $28.00 NO BID NO BID
989-666-6263

Ocenasek $30.40 $30.40 $41.24 $30.90 $30.90 $31.10 $31.10 NO BID NO BID

517-625-3242




