
               
Bidders 23A Delivered 22A Delivered 3/16 x 1/8 Chip 23A Delivered 22A Delivered 23A Delivered 22A Delivered 23A 22A

Corunna Ave Corunna Ave Delivered Corunna Lansing Rd Lansing Rd Ruess Rd Ruess Rd Picked Up Picked Up

Burroughs North

989-737-2861

Fisher Transportation

989-773-1376

Great Lakes Fusion

989-288-2656

Jackson Trucking

989-494-9979

Ocenasek

517-625-3242

Sumbera Excavating

989-723-1985

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.25 $28.25

$28.10 $35.60 $28.10 $28.10 $29.10 $29.10

$27.89 $27.89 $27.29 $27.29 $28.09 $28.09

$31.00 $30.70 $31.00 $30.70 $28.50 NO BID

NO BID NO BID

$29.96
H-1 Blue as 

alternate at $38.62 

per US ton

$30.46 $30.46 $31.52 $31.52 NO BID NO BID

$31.00

$27.29

$28.10

NO BID

$26.50 NO BID

$30.70 NO BID

$27.29 NO BID

Shiawassee County Road Commission
2024 Limestone

Bid opening on February 27, 2024

Board Approved on March 13, 2024

$26.25

$29.96

$27.25 $27.50 $27.00 $27.25


