

**Shiawassee County Road Commission**  
**Fuel Bid - Period November 1, 2022 through October 31, 2023**  
**Bid Extension from October 9, 2017**

Board Approved on October 12, 2022

**Fuel Bid Delivered**

| <b>No 2 Diesel Fuel</b>                      | Rack Summer | Rack Winter | Lock In Over Cost               | Total Cost<br>Summer / Winter  | Notes  |
|--|-------------|-------------|---------------------------------|--------------------------------|--|
| Coffield Oil Company, Inc.<br>989-288-6756   | 1.8570      | 1.8700      | 0.06                            | 1.9170 Summer<br>1.930 Winter  |  |
| J & H Oil Co. - Stechschulte<br>989-723-8831 | 1.8311      | 1.8511      | 0.05                            | 1.8811 Summer<br>1.9011 Winter |  |
| Webster & Garner, Inc.<br>810-686-9171       | 1.8975      | 1.8975      | 0.08950 Summer<br>0.1045 Winter | 1.9870 Summer<br>2.0020 Winter |  |
| RKA Petroleum Companies<br>734-946-2199      | 1.9646      | 1.9646      | 0.1436 Summer<br>0.1686 Winter  | 2.1082 Summer<br>2.1332 Winter | Flint, MI OPIS Daily Rack Price used was<br>10/2/2017 (document attached to bid) |

*Card System Required*

**Station Pick Up**

| <b>No 2 Diesel Fuel</b>                             | Rack Summer        | Rack Winter        | Lock In Over Cost | Total Cost<br>Summer / Winter  | Notes   |
|---|--------------------|--------------------|-------------------|--------------------------------|---|
| Road Trip Oasis/Markham Enterprises<br>517-861-7366 | As Published Daily | As Published Daily | +7                | 7 Cents Over Rack              | New pumps and card readers on pumps. Free<br>coffee or fountain drink for drivers when fueling. |
| Coffield Oil Company, Inc.<br>989-288-6756          | 1.8570             | 1.8700             | 0.06              | 1.9170 Summer<br>1.9300 Winter |   |
| J & H Oil Co. - Stechschulte<br>989-723-8831        | 1.8311             | 1.8511             | 0.05              | 1.8811 Summer<br>1.9011 Winter |   |
| Webster & Garner, Inc.<br>810-686-9171              | <i>No Bid</i>      |                    |                   |                                |   |
| RKA Petroleum Companies<br>734-946-2199             | <i>No Bid</i>      |                    |                   |                                |   |

| <b>No Lead Fuel</b>                                 | Rack               | Lock In Over Cost | Total Cost        | Notes   |
|---|--------------------|-------------------|-------------------|---|
| Road Trip Oasis/Markham Enterprises<br>517-861-7366 | As Published Daily | +7                | 7 Cents Over Rack | New pumps and card readers on pumps. Free<br>coffee or fountain drink for drivers when fueling. |
| Coffield Oil Company, Inc.<br>989-288-6756          | 1.5975             | 0.06              | 1.6575            |   |
| J & H Oil Co. - Stechschulte<br>989-723-8831        | 1.5895             | 0.05              | 1.6395            |   |
| Webster & Garner, Inc.<br>810-686-9171              | <i>No Bid</i>      |                   |                   |   |
| RKA Petroleum Companies<br>734-946-2199             | <i>No Bid</i>      |                   |                   |   |