

**Shiawassee County Road Commission
2022 Guardrail and Post Materials
Bid Opening on March 1, 2022
Board Approved on March 15, 2022**

	New Galv Type B Guardrail	Used Galv Type B Guardrail	Guardrail Thrie Beam	Wood Post 6"x8"x7'	Wood Block 6"x8"x15"	Steel Post 7'	Wood Breakaway 6"x8"x45"	Wood Breakaway 6"x8"x72"	Bolt On Guardrail Reflectors	Pick Up Discount	SRT Guardrail Ending Installed	SRT Guardrail Ending	SKT Guardrail Ending Installed	SKT Guardrail Ending	Installation County Wide Per Lineal Foot
Bidders															
Action Traffic 810-853-2006	\$162.00	\$112.00	\$280.00	\$92.00	\$18.25	\$88.50	\$55.65	\$85.00	\$7.00	5%	\$1,500	\$1,850	\$1,500	\$2,660	\$18.00
<i>Notes:</i>															
Jensen Bridge 810-648-3000	\$155.00	\$155.00	\$275.00	\$72.06	\$19.08	\$84.29	\$54.93	\$87.89	\$4.80	0%	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<i>Notes</i> Terms: 1% 10 net 30. Prices good for 90 days. After 90 days, prices will be reviewed for possible increase or decrease relative to current market conditions.															
Nationwide 586-749-6900	\$240.00	NO BID	\$380.00	\$130.00	\$28.00	\$122.00	\$78.00	\$120.00	\$10.00	2.50%	\$2,000	\$3,300	\$2,000	\$3,800	\$25.00
<i>Notes</i> \$5,000.00 minimum order required for installation.															