

Shiawassee County Road Commission
2022 Bituminous Paving Program / Asphalt Overlay Projects
Bid Opening on March 1, 2022
Board Approved on March 15, 2022

ASPHALT OVERLAY PROJECTS					Ace-Saginaw Paving 810-238-1737			Michigan Paving & Materials 517-749-2994			Pyramid Paving & Contracting 989-895-5861			Rieth-Riley Construction 517-599-2849		
Township / Road	Asphalt Tons	Asphalt Tons - 5E1	Shoulder Tons - Gravel	Shoulder Tons - Limestone	Price Asphalt	Price Shoulder	Total	Price Asphalt	Price Shoulder	Total	Price Asphalt	Price Shoulder	Total	Price Asphalt	Price Shoulder	Total
Middlebury / Golden Stallion Estates	400		100		\$110.00	\$78.00	\$51,800.00	\$90.00	\$95.00	\$45,500.00	\$99.60	\$47.00	\$44,540.00	\$111.40	\$50.00	\$49,560.00
Perry / Raelyn Hills Sub	1,250		250		\$94.00	\$48.00	\$129,500.00	\$79.00	\$45.00	\$110,000.00			NO BID	\$111.40	\$50.00	\$151,750.00
Perry / Forest Greens Sub	1,600		N/A		\$105.00		\$168,000.00	\$79.00		\$126,400.00			NO BID	\$111.40		\$178,240.00
Perry / Forest Greens Sub		1,600	N/A		\$107.00		\$171,200.00	\$80.00		\$128,000.00			NO BID	\$119.40		\$191,040.00
Rush / Smith	2,550		550		\$75.00	\$31.00	\$208,300.00	\$72.00	\$35.00	\$202,850.00	\$82.50	\$25.95	\$224,647.50	\$84.00	\$50.00	\$241,700.00
Woodhull / Beard	2,800			700	\$74.00	\$45.00	\$238,700.00	\$70.00	\$45.00	\$227,500.00			NO BID	\$82.00	\$50.00	\$264,600.00
Woodhull / Beard	2,800		700		\$74.00	\$28.00	\$226,800.00	\$70.00	\$35.00	\$220,500.00			NO BID	\$82.00	\$60.00	\$271,600.00
Woodhull / Braden	1,479			350	\$82.00	\$56.00	\$140,878.00	\$76.00	\$45.00	\$128,154.00			NO BID	\$84.00	\$75.00	\$150,486.00