

**Shiawassee County Road Commission
2021 Signs & Sign Posts
Bid opening on February 23, 2021**

High Intensity Prismatic	Action Traffic 810-853-2006	Dornbos Sign 517-543-4000	Lightle 740-998-5363	MD Solutions 614-873-2222	Newman 800-437-9770	Rathco 269-323-0153
30"x 30" STOP	30.73	25.04	26.85	NO BID	29.88	25.63
30"x 30" STOP AHEAD SYMBOL	31.02	28.66	29.90	NO BID	29.88	28.56
36"X 36" STOP	44.25	37.36	38.30	NO BID	43.03	36.90
36"X 36" STOP AHEAD SYMBOL	44.68	41.17	43.20	NO BID	43.03	41.25
30"X 30" YIELD SYMBOL	30.73	21.44	29.90	NO BID	29.88	15.00
36" RR ADVANCE WARNING	44.25	37.71	39.87	NO BID	43.03	36.90
48"X 9" RAILROAD CROSS BUCK ASSEMBLY	NO BID	47.86	26.58	NO BID	14.34	65.00
12"X 6" REGULATORY	2.46	2.10	2.40	NO BID	2.39	3.95
12"X 12" REGULATORY	4.92	4.19	4.50	NO BID	4.78	5.25
12"X 18" REGULATORY	7.38	6.29	6.65	NO BID	7.17	7.50
18"X 6" REGULATORY	3.69	3.14	3.40	NO BID	3.59	4.25
18"X 18" REGULATORY	11.06	9.43	9.97	NO BID	10.76	9.56
24"x 10" REGULATORY	8.20	7.00	7.40	NO BID	7.97	7.50
24"x 12" REGULATORY	9.83	8.38	8.86	NO BID	9.56	8.50
24"x 18" REGULATORY	14.75	12.57	13.29	NO BID	14.34	12.75
24"x 24" REGULATORY	19.67	16.76	17.72	NO BID	19.13	17.00
24"x 30" REGULATORY	24.59	20.95	22.15	NO BID	23.91	21.25
30"x 12" REGULATORY	12.29	10.48	11.08	NO BID	11.95	10.63
30"x 30" REGULATORY	30.73	26.19	27.69	NO BID	29.88	26.56
30"x 36" REGULATORY	36.88	31.43	33.23	NO BID	35.86	31.88
36"x 12" REGULATORY	14.75	12.57	13.29	NO BID	14.34	12.75
48"x 24" REGULATORY	39.36	33.52	35.44	NO BID	38.25	34.00
48"x 30" REGULATORY	49.17	41.90	44.30	NO BID	47.81	42.50
60"x 30" REGULATORY	61.64	52.38	55.38	NO BID	59.77	53.13
18"x 18" WARNING	11.06	9.43	9.97	NO BID	10.76	9.56
18"x 24" WARNING	14.75	12.57	13.29	NO BID	14.34	12.75
30"x 12" WARNING	12.29	10.48	11.08	NO BID	11.95	10.63
24"x 30" WARNING	24.59	20.95	22.15	NO BID	23.91	21.25
30"x 30" WARNING	30.73	26.19	27.69	NO BID	29.88	26.56
12"x 36" WARNING	14.75	12.57	13.29	NO BID	14.34	12.75
36"x 36" WARNING	44.25	37.71	39.87	NO BID	43.03	38.25
48"x 24" WARNING	39.34	33.52	35.44	NO BID	38.25	34.00
24"x 8" YELLOW/GREEN SCHOOL 3M #4083	9.01	7.87	7.70	NO BID	10.10	8.00

**Shiawassee County Road Commission
2021 Signs & Sign Posts
Bid opening on February 23, 2021**

High Intensity Prismatic	Action Traffic 810-853-2006	Dornbos Sign 517-543-4000	Lightle 740-998-5363	MD Solutions 614-873-2222	Newman 800-437-9770	Rathco 269-323-0153
24"x 12" YELLOW/GREEN SCHOOL 3M #4083	13.52	11.84	11.44	NO BID	15.14	12.00
30"x 30" YELLOW/GREEN SCHOOL 3M #4083	42.24	37.00	35.75	NO BID	47.32	37.40
36"x 36" YELLOW/GREEN SCHOOL 3M #4083	60.82	53.28	51.48	NO BID	68.14	54.00
24"x 12" CONSTRUCTION	12.08	8.38	8.86	NO BID	9.56	8.50
24"x 18" CONSTRUCTION	18.13	12.57	13.29	NO BID	14.34	12.75
30"x 24" CONSTRUCTION	30.21	20.95	22.15	NO BID	23.91	21.25
30"x 30" CONSTRUCTION	37.76	26.19	27.69	NO BID	29.88	26.56
36"x 36" CONSTRUCTION	54.38	37.71	39.87	NO BID	43.03	38.25
48"x 18" CONSTRUCTION	36.25	25.14	26.58	NO BID	28.69	25.50
48"x 48" CONSTRUCTION	96.67	67.04	70.88	NO BID	76.50	68.00
24"x 6" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 3/4" RADIUS	4.92	4.19	4.30	5.23	4.46	5.00
30"x 6" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 3/4" RADIUS	6.15	5.24	5.38	6.54	5.58	6.25
36"x 6" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 3/4" RADIUS	7.38	6.29	6.45	7.85	6.69	7.50
42"x 6" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 3/4" RADIUS	8.61	7.33	7.53	9.15	7.81	8.75
48"x 6" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 3/4" RADIUS	9.83	8.38	8.60	10.46	8.93	10.00
24"x 9" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 1-1/2" RADIUS	7.38	6.29	6.45	7.85	6.69	7.50
30"x 9" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 1-1/2" RADIUS	9.22	7.88	8.06	9.81	8.37	9.38
36"x 9" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 1-1/2" RADIUS	11.06	9.43	9.68	11.77	10.04	11.25
42"x 9" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 1-1/2" RADIUS	12.91	11.02	11.29	13.73	11.71	13.25
48"x 9" FLAT SIGN BLANKS #3930 1-1/2" RADIUS	14.75	12.57	12.90	15.69	13.39	15.00
3M HIP REFLECTIVE SHEETING WHITE #3930 24"x50 YDS	380.36	381.00	325.50	357.00	395.67	390.00
3M HIP REFLECTIVE SHEETING WHITE #3930 30"x50 YDS	475.45	476.25	406.88	446.25	494.59	490.00
3M HIP REFLECTIVE SHEETING YELLOW #3931 24"x50 YDS	380.36	381.00	325.50	357.00	395.67	390.00
3M HIP REFLECTIVE SHEETING YELLOW #3931 30"x50 YDS	475.45	476.25	406.88	446.25	494.59	490.00
3# FT. GREEN U CHANNEL SIGN POSTS	NO BID	2.50	2.80	2.21	NO BID	2.085 *
3# FT. GALVANIZED U CHANNEL SIGN POSTS	3.50	3.25	3.50	2.76	NO BID	3.00 *
24"x 8" HIP TYPE II BARRICADES	NO BID	45.00	46.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
NOTES						* 20,000 lb order minimum, ok to combine Green and Galvanized