

**Shiawassee County Road Commission  
2021 Sand  
Bid opening on February 23, 2021**

<b>Bidder</b>	<b>2 NS Sand Delivered Corunna</b>	<b>2 NS Sand Delivered Perry</b>	<b>2 NS Sand Picked Up</b>	<b>Class II Sand Delivered Corunna</b>	<b>Class II Sand Picked Up</b>
Constine Gravel 989-723-6043	\$9.75	\$9.75	\$5.75	\$7.00	\$4.00
Fuoss Gravel 989-725-2084	\$8.00	\$8.00	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$4.00
Great Lakes Fusion 989-288-2656	\$11.10	\$9.70	\$12.50	\$9.00	\$10.40
Jackson Trucking 989-494-9979	\$7.03	\$7.03	NO BID	\$6.53	NO BID
Ocenasek 517-625-3242	\$7.50	\$7.50	NO BID	\$6.75	NO BID
Searles Construction 989-224-3297	\$6.45	\$7.45	NO BID	\$5.30	NO BID
Stoneco of Michigan 517-688-9703	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sumbera Excavating 989-723-1985	\$8.50	\$9.50	\$5.00	\$8.50	\$5.00