

**Shiawassee County Road Commission
2021 Limestone
Bid opening on February 23, 2021**

Bidders	23A Delivered Corunna Ave	22A Delivered Corunna Ave	3/16 x 1/8 Chip Delivered Corunna	23A Delivered Lansing Rd	22A Delivered Lansing Rd	23A Delivered Ruess Rd	22A Delivered Ruess Rd	23A Picked Up	22A Picked Up
Burroughs North 989-737-2861	\$21.60	\$21.65	NO BID	\$22.60	\$22.65	\$21.60	\$21.65	NO BID	NO BID
Fisher Transportation 989-773-1376	\$23.21	\$23.21	\$30.41 H-1 BLUE	\$23.97	\$23.97	\$23.97	\$23.97	NO BID	NO BID
Fuoss Gravel 989-725-2084	\$27.00	\$27.00	NO BID	\$27.00	\$27.00	\$27.00	\$27.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
Great Lakes Fusion 989-288-2656	\$21.92	\$22.40	NO BID	\$21.92	\$22.40	\$23.32	\$23.80	\$19.12	\$19.60
Jackson Trucking 989-494-9979	\$20.10	\$20.35	NO BID	\$20.20	\$20.45	\$20.10	\$20.35	NO BID	NO BID
MI Paving & Materials 734-241-8966	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Ocnasek 517-625-3242	\$24.00	\$24.00	\$31.45	\$24.75	\$24.75	\$24.75	\$24.75	NO BID	NO BID
Searles Construction 989-224-3297	NO BID	NO BID	\$23.00 NATURAL STONE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sumbera Excavating 989-723-1985	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.50
Constine Transport	BID RECEIVED AFTER DUE DATE								