

**Shiawassee County Road Commission  
2021 Gravel Hauling Bid  
Bid opening on February 9, 2021**

Bidder		Fisher Transport. 989-773-1376	Ocenasek 517-625-3242	L & D Carey 231-856-4324	Jackson Trucking 989-494-9979
Antrim	23A Ruess	4.35	3.80	3.74	4.37
Antrim	23A Private	NO BID	13.50	NO BID	NO BID
Antrim	22A Private	NO BID	13.50	NO BID	NO BID
Bennington	23A Ruess	3.03	2.65	2.70	3.13
Bennington	23A Private	NO BID	12.00	NO BID	NO BID
Bennington	22A Private	NO BID	12.00	NO BID	NO BID
Burns	23A Ruess	5.25	4.85	4.58	4.98
Burns	23A Private	NO BID	13.50	NO BID	NO BID
Burns	22A Private	NO BID	13.50	NO BID	NO BID
Caledonia	23A Ruess	3.34	3.22	3.13	3.75
Caledonia	23A Private	NO BID	12.25	NO BID	NO BID
Caledonia	22A Private	NO BID	12.25	NO BID	NO BID
Fairfield	23A Ruess	3.28	2.75	2.80	3.13
Fairfield	23A Private	NO BID	11.75	NO BID	NO BID
Fairfield	22A Private	NO BID	11.75	NO BID	NO BID
Hazelton	23A Ruess	4.58	4.49	4.52	4.37
Hazelton	23A Private	NO BID	13.50	NO BID	NO BID
Hazelton	22A Private	NO BID	13.50	NO BID	NO BID
Middlebury	23A Ruess	2.60	2.64	2.35	2.69
Middlebury	23A Private	NO BID	12.00	NO BID	NO BID
Middlebury	22A Private	NO BID	12.00	NO BID	NO BID
New Haven	23A Ruess	3.96	3.33	3.20	3.95
New Haven	23A Private	NO BID	13.00	NO BID	NO BID
New Haven	22A Private	NO BID	13.00	NO BID	NO BID
Owosso	23A Ruess	2.52	2.16	2.08	2.28
Owosso	23A Private	NO BID	11.75	NO BID	NO BID
Owosso	22A Private	NO BID	11.75	NO BID	NO BID
Perry	23A Ruess	3.56	3.11	3.08	3.50
Perry	23A Private	NO BID	12.10	NO BID	NO BID
Perry	22A Private	NO BID	12.10	NO BID	NO BID
Rush	23A Ruess	3.24	2.83	2.70	2.87
Rush	23A Private	NO BID	12.00	NO BID	NO BID
Rush	22A Private	NO BID	12.00	NO BID	NO BID
Sciota	23A Ruess	3.56	2.82	2.78	3.37
Sciota	23A Private	NO BID	12.50	NO BID	NO BID
Sciota	22A Private	NO BID	12.50	NO BID	NO BID
Shiawassee	23A Ruess	4.49	3.60	3.30	3.75
Shiawassee	23A Private	NO BID	13.00	NO BID	NO BID
Shiawassee	22A Private	NO BID	13.00	NO BID	NO BID
Venice	23A Ruess	4.39	4.09	3.83	4.13
Venice	23A Private	NO BID	13.25	NO BID	NO BID
Venice	22A Private	NO BID	13.25	NO BID	NO BID
Vernon	23A Ruess	5.13	4.63	4.40	4.38
Vernon	23A Private	NO BID	13.75	NO BID	NO BID
Vernon	22A Private	NO BID	13.75	NO BID	NO BID
Woodhull	23A Ruess	4.12	3.78	3.63	3.88
Woodhull	23A Private	NO BID	13.00	NO BID	NO BID
Woodhull	22A Private	NO BID	13.00	NO BID	NO BID