
Bidders

Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

Waterborne Pavement Marking 

Yellow Centerline     70 lane miles 0.0430 0.0456 13,680.00

White Edge Line        4 lane miles 0.0430 0.0456 1,926.14

Special Pavement Marking

Railroad Marking (Paint) 12 ea 85.00 1,020.00 120.00 1,440.00

Railroad Marking (Termal Plastic) 12 ea NO BID NO BID 250.00 3,000.00

Thermal Rumble Strips (Hot Poured) NO BID NO BID 5.25

Thermal Plastic 12" Stop Bar NO BID NO BID 5.00

School Zone (2 each) 50.00 100.00 100.00 200.00

20,246.14

M & M Pavement Marking P.K. Contracting, Inc.

Shiawassee County Road Commission

2020 Pavement Marking

Bid Extension from March 16, 2012

Board approved on November 12, 2019


