

**Shiawassee County Road Commission
2020 Grass Seed & Mulch
Bid opening on February 25, 2020**

Bidder	5000 lbs Grass Seed Per lb.	2500 lbs Grass Seed Per lb.	1000 lbs Grass Seed Per lb.	Price Per lb. Picked Up	19 Ton Mulch Price per ton	10 Ton Mulch Price per ton	Notes
Hanes Geo Components 734-779-4990	\$1.12	\$1.12	\$1.12	\$1.12	\$439.00	\$439.00	
La Crosse Seed 517-749-7364	\$1.10	\$1.10	\$1.10	\$1.10	\$442.50	\$492.50	Seed: 50% coated with ProNitro Polymer and Micro Package Mulch: Nu-Wool Hydro Green w/t 40# unit
Rhino Seed & Landscape 810-632-5640	\$1.21	\$1.21	\$1.21	\$1.16	\$588.40	\$588.40	
SiteOne Landscape 216-706-9250	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$10,996.65 (\$578.77 per ton)	\$5,732.40 (\$573.24 per ton)	