

**Shiawassee County Road Commission
2020 Bituminous Paving Program Bid
Bid opening on February 11, 2020**

Scratch Course Paving		Ace-Saginaw Paving 810-238-1737		Michigan Paving 517-482-9611		Rieth-Riley 517-599-2849	
Township / Road	Tons	Price per ton	Total	Price per ton	Total	Price per ton	Total
Bennington / Friegel Bennington to Garrison	800	\$72.70	\$58,160.00	\$82.00	\$65,600.00	NO BID	
Burns / Cole Grand River east .93 miles	875	\$72.05	\$63,043.75	\$81.00	\$70,875.00	NO BID	
Caledonia / Hibbard Cook to State	2,100	\$68.60	\$144,060.00	\$76.00	\$159,600.00	\$73.70	\$154,770.00
Fairfield / Meridian Juddville to Riley	765	\$74.90	\$57,298.50	\$83.00	\$63,495.00	NO BID	
Hazelton / Henderson Byron to New Lothrop	875	\$71.70	\$62,737.50	\$83.00	\$72,625.00	NO BID	
New Haven / Riley Kerby to .40 miles west of Cram	900	\$72.65	\$65,385.00	\$84.00	\$75,600.00	\$84.40	\$75,960.00
Owosso Charter / Smith Mason to Wilkinson	840	\$73.85	\$62,034.00	\$82.00	\$68,880.00	\$84.40	\$70,896.00
Perry / Locke M-52 to Lovejoy	1,000	\$72.45	\$72,450.00	\$79.00	\$79,000.00	\$78.87	\$78,870.00
Perry / Bennett Dr Lansing to Britton	400	\$89.60	\$35,840.00	\$99.00	\$39,600.00	\$98.12	\$39,248.00
Rush / Delaney Juddville to Riley	840	\$73.85	\$62,034.00	\$83.00	\$69,720.00	\$86.22	\$72,424.80
Sciota / Shaftsbury Brewer to Doyle	375	\$93.30	\$34,987.50	\$99.00	\$37,125.00	\$100.49	\$37,683.75
Sciota / Brewer Shaftsbury to Bennington Twp Ln	740	\$74.30	\$54,982.00	\$83.00	\$61,420.00	\$82.87	\$61,323.80
Vernon / New Lothrop Lansing to Newburg	800	\$71.15	\$56,920.00	\$82.00	\$65,600.00	NO BID	
Vernon / Bennington M-71 to Durand	1,330	\$69.75	\$92,767.50	\$80.00	\$106,400.00	NO BID	
Woodhull / Beard Hidden Lakes Sub to Perry Twp Line	1,250	\$72.00	\$90,000.00	\$78.00	\$97,500.00	\$75.95	\$94,937.50
Butt Joint Milling 4' To 5' Width (Per Linear Foot)		\$35.00		\$60.00		\$20.00	
Structure Adjustment 0 to 6"		\$800.00		\$600.00		\$600.00	
Structure Adjustment 6 to 18"		\$1,000.00		\$750.00		\$1,000.00	
Water Box		\$600.00		\$500.00		\$600.00	
Bid Bond Enclosed		YES		YES		YES	