Shiawassee County Road Commission
2020 Bituminous Paving Program Bid

Bid opening on February 11, 2020

Ace-Saginaw Paving Michigan Paving Rieth-Riley
Asphalt Overlay 810-238-1737 517-482-9611 517-599-2849
Asphalt | Shoulder Price Price Total Price Price Total Price Price Total
Township / Road Tons Tons Asphalt Shoulder Asphalt Shoulder Asphalt Shoulder
Antrim / State Road 2,500 550 $68.95 $31.05 [ $189,452.50| $65.00 $30.00 $179,000.00 [ NO BID NO BID
Venice / New Lothrop Road 1,700 370 $66.65 $33.10 [ $125,552.00| $77.00 $40.00 $145,700.00 | NO BID NO BID
Venice / Lennon Road 1,000 200 $68.95 $38.00 $76,550.00 $79.00 $50.00 $89,000.00 NO BID NO BID




