

**Shiawassee County Road Commission
2019 Process Gravel
Bid opening on February 26, 2019**

Bidder	Phone Number	22A/Ton Delivered	22A/Ton Picked Up	23A/Ton Delivered	23A/Ton Picked Up
Fuoss Gravel Company	989-725-2084	9.75	7.30	9.50	6.90
Ocenasek, Inc	517-625-3242	10.00	7.50	10.00	7.50
Constine Gravel Company	989-723-6043	9.48	7.50	9.48	7.50
Searles Construction, Inc	989-224-3297	10.08	NO BID	9.08	NO BID
Stoneco of Michigan	734-770-5733	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sumbera Excavating, Inc	989-723-1985	12.05	9.25	12.05	9.25