

**Shiawassee County Road Commission
2019 Limestone
Bid opening on February 26, 2019**

Bidders	23A Delivered Corunna Ave	22A Delivered Corunna Ave	3/16 x 1/8 Chip Delivered Corunna	23A Delivered Lansing Rd	22A Delivered Lansing Rd	23A Delivered Ruess Rd	22A Delivered Ruess Rd	23A Picked Up	22A Picked Up
Fuoss Gravel Company 989-725-2084	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	25.00	No Bid
Burroughs North 989-399-1005	20.90	20.95	No Bid	21.90	21.95	20.90	20.95	No Bid	No Bid
Ocenasek, Inc 517-625-3242	24.00	24.00	31.45	24.75	24.75	24.75	24.75	28.00	28.00
Fisher Transportation Co 989-773-1376	21.73	21.73	Alternate H-1 Blue 29.17	22.45	22.45	22.45	22.45	No Bid	No Bid
Constine Gravel Company 989-723-6043	18.49	18.74	No Bid	18.74	18.99	18.74	18.99	34.00/Yard	34.00/Yard
Smith Sand & Gravel 517-625-3228	19.75	20.50	No Bid	19.75	20.50	19.75	20.50	19.75	20.50
Stoneco 734-770-5733	20.80	21.25	No Bid	20.80	21.25	20.80	21.25	17.85 *	17.85 *
Sumbera Excavating, Inc 989-723-1985	22.85	22.85	No Bid	23.95	23.95	22.85	22.85	23.50	23.50

* 6299 Belleview Ave, Flint, MI