

**Shiawassee County Road Commission  
2019 Guardrail, Post Materials  
Action Traffic Maintenance bid extension from 2018  
Board approved on January 22, 2019**

| <b>Bidders</b>                                | <b>New Galv<br/>Type B<br/>Guardrail</b> | <b>Used Galv<br/>Type B<br/>Guardrail</b> | <b>Guardrail<br/>Thrie<br/>Beam</b> | <b>Wood<br/>Post<br/>6"x8"x7'</b> | <b>Wood<br/>Block<br/>6"x8"x15"</b> | <b>Steel<br/>Post<br/>7'</b> | <b>Wood<br/>Breakaway<br/>6"x8"x45"</b> | <b>Wood<br/>Breakaway<br/>6"x8"x72"</b> | <b>Bolt On<br/>Guardrail<br/>Reflectors</b> | <b>Pick Up<br/>Discount</b> | <b>SRT<br/>Guardrail<br/>Ending<br/>Installed</b> | <b>SRT<br/>Guardrail<br/>Ending</b> | <b>SKT<br/>Guardrail<br/>Ending<br/>Installed</b> | <b>SKT<br/>Guardrail<br/>Ending</b> | <b>Installation<br/>County Wide<br/>Per Lineal Foot</b> |
|---|--|---|-------------------------------------|-----------------------------------|-------------------------------------|------------------------------|---|---|---|-----------------------------|---|-------------------------------------|---|-------------------------------------|---|
| Jensen Bridge<br>810-648-3000                 | 72.00                                    | No Bid                                    | 114.50                              | 59.71                             | 11.57                               | 40.63                        | 39.71                                   | No Bid                                  | 3.21  | No Bid                      | No Bid  | 1,878.57                            | No Bid  | 2,178.57                            | No Bid  |
| Nationwide<br>Construction *<br>586-749-6900  | 67.50                                    | (if available)<br>40.00                   | 103.00                              | 52.00                             | 10.75                               | 44.75                        | 29.25                                   | 44.25                                   | 3.10  | 3%                          | 650.00  | 1,675.00                            | 700.00  | 2,000.00                            | 6.00  |
| Action Traffic<br>Maintenance<br>989-620-0263 | 67.50                                    | 30.00                                     | 112.00                              | 46.50                             | 8.75                                | 43.95                        | 30.00                                   | 40.00                                   | 3.05  | 2%                          | 525.00  | 1,450.00                            | 575.00  | 1,825.00                            | 4.85  |

\* \$5,000.00 Minimum Order Requirement