

**Shiawassee County Road Commission
2018 Process Gravel
Bid opening on February 27, 2018**

Bidder	Phone Number	22A/Ton Delivered	22A/Ton Picked Up	23A/Ton Delivered	23A/Ton Picked Up
Ace-Saginaw Paving Co.	989-737-2861	No Bid	No Bid	14.00	6.75
Sumbera Excavating	989-723-1985	11.95	9.25	11.95	9.25
Fuoss Gravel Co.	989-725-2084	9.49	7.00	9.49	7.00
Constine Gravel Co	989-723-6043	8.49	7.00	8.49	7.00
Ocenasek, Inc.	517-625-3242	10.00	7.50	10.00	7.50
L & D Carey & Sons Trucking	231-856-4324	10.35	No Bid	10.35	No Bid