

**Shiawassee County Road Commission
2018 Grass Seed & Mulch
Bid opening on February 27, 2018**

Bidder	Phone	5000 lbs Grass Seed Per lb.	2500 lbs Grass Seed Per lb.	1000 lbs Grass Seed Per lb.	Price Per lb. Picked Up	19 Ton Mulch Price per ton	10 Ton Mulch Price per ton	Notes
SiteOne Landscape Supply	800-321-5325 ext. 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	382.40 (Bid price 7,265.60)	407.60 (Bid price 4,076.00)	#10-0011 Applegate Hydro-lok Mulch 50 lb
Hanes Geo Components	734-779-4990	1.06	1.06	1.06	1.06	369.75	369.75	
La Crosse Seed	517-749-7364	1.39	1.39	1.39	1.39	435.00	457.50	Nu-Wool Hydro Green w/Tac